
                                                                      City College 
                                               102/1, Raja Rammohan Sarani, Kolkata-9 
                                                                   Notice-28.01.2024 
 
This is notified for information of all that City College is going to conduct C.U. B.A./B.Sc./ 
B.Com. Semester V (Honours and General) examination, 2024 under CBCS from 30.01.2024 
(Tuesday) to 15.02.2024 (Thursday) in two halves from 10:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m. and 2:00 
p.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
 
All teaching staff including SACTs of the College are required to perform invigilation duties 
as per schedule prepared by Examination Sub-Committee. They are requested to report 
positively by 9:30 a.m. and follow strictly the “Examination Guidelines for the Invigilators” 
already notified and whatapped on 27.01.2024 by the Examination Committee. 
 
All invigilators are requested to perform the invigilation duties carefully to avoid any 
unforeseen circumstances. They should be very careful during verification of details entered 
by the candidate on the answer scripts and their signature on the answer-scripts and admit 
cards, and also during candidate’s signature on DR Sheet and making absent mark by them 
on DR Sheet in case of absent of a candidate. 
 
Non-teaching staff of the College having examination duties in the examination rooms and 
office as per schedule prepared by the Head Clerk are also requested to report positively by 
9:30 a.m.  
 
The Convener, Joint Conveners and members of the examination Committee, Head Clerk 
and concerned Office Staff of the Examination Committee are requested to make necessary 
arrangements for the said Examination. 
 
All classes of B.A./B.Sc./B.Com Semester-I under 3-year (Multidisciplinary) and 4-year 
(Major) Courses of Studies of Academic Session 2023-24 and B.A./B.Sc./B.Com Semester-
III (Honours & General) under CBCS of the Academic Session 2022-23 will remain 
suspended from 30.01.2024 (Tuesday) to 15.02.2024 (Thursday) due to the aforesaid 
examinations. 
 
The resumption of normal classes of B.A./B.Sc./B.Com Semester-I under 3-year 
(Multidisciplinary) and 4-year (Major) Courses of Studies of Academic Session 2023-24 and 
B.A./B.Sc./B.Com Semester-III (Honours & General) under CBCS of the Academic Session 
2022-23 will be notified in due time. 
 

                                                                     
Copy to:  IQAC, Vice Principal, Bursar, Office                                       Principal 
                 Notice Board, Staff Room, Depts. (5),                       City College, Kolkata-9 
                  Library, Students’ Union. 

                                                                                                                  


